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Like so many other ethnic groups, Chicanos and Chicanas have suffered from political, social, and economic
oppression in the United States. In addition to the problems they endure as a consequence of their ethnicity,
Chicanas are further subordinated because of their gender. As women, they are treated inequitably by a
culture in which authority is invested primarily in men, to the point that they are relegated to a separate
social class. The experiences of Chicanas are presented in the works of contemporary Chicana writers who
explore the inequitable power relations that adversely affect these women because of their gender. This book
analyzes the representation of these outclassed Chicanas in the works of contemporary Chicana authors.

The first part of the volume treats the major concerns and themes of Chicana writers in terms of the problems
caused by inequitable gendered power relations. Some of the writers discussed include Sandra Cisneros,
Roberta Fernández, Kathleen Alcala, Gloria Anzaldúa, and Ana Castillo. The second part looks at some of
the solutions proposed by Chicana writers in response to inequitable gender roles. The final portion of the
volume explores the relationship between Chicanas and other women writers and critics of color, Jewish
feminists, and the mainstream feminist movement.
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From reader reviews:

Ryan Mendoza:

The book (Out)Classed Women: Contemporary Chicana Writers on Inequitable Gendered Power Relations
(Contributions in Women's Studies) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the great thing like a book (Out)Classed Women:
Contemporary Chicana Writers on Inequitable Gendered Power Relations (Contributions in Women's
Studies)? Some of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book can give many data for
us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take
for that, you may give for each other; you could share all of these. Book (Out)Classed Women:
Contemporary Chicana Writers on Inequitable Gendered Power Relations (Contributions in Women's
Studies) has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can look the
enormous world by open up and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Rosa Tarpley:

This book untitled (Out)Classed Women: Contemporary Chicana Writers on Inequitable Gendered Power
Relations (Contributions in Women's Studies) to be one of several books that will best seller in this year,
that's because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this
specific book in the book store or you can order it through online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book
too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is
no reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Elizabeth Morris:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader
with their story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write
about the ability about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is
this (Out)Classed Women: Contemporary Chicana Writers on Inequitable Gendered Power Relations
(Contributions in Women's Studies).

Willie Adams:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day by watching television programs or just resting
on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This (Out)Classed Women: Contemporary Chicana Writers
on Inequitable Gendered Power Relations (Contributions in Women's Studies) can be the solution, oh how
comes? It's a book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this fresh era



is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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