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DUI defense attorneys have many persuasion hurdles to overcome in the courtroom, but most clients cannot
afford the platinum preparation level. Bruce Kapsack’s Innovative DUI Trial Tools helps you deliver the
defense your clients want at a price they can afford. This one-of-a-kind book from one of the country’s top
DUI defenders provides creative evidence, forms, arguments, and
cross-examination questions ready for implementation in your next case.

The book contains discovery requests, motions in limine, pattern questions for voir dire, model openings,
cross-examination questions for all types of prosecution witnesses, direct examination questions for lay and
expert defense witnesses, closing phrases for common issues, complete closings, and ready-to-use
demonstrative evidence.

Bruce Kapsack’s Innovative DUI Trial Tools provides strategies and language for persuading both hearts and
minds. These methods and arguments have succeeded in trial after trial, and can work for you.
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From reader reviews:

Hollie Hoffman:

This book untitled Innovative DUI Trial Tools to be one of several books in which best seller in this year,
honestly, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to
buy this particular book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with
this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Mobile phone. So there is no reason for you to past this book from your list.

Margaret Coleman:

Beside this specific Innovative DUI Trial Tools in your phone, it can give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from oven so don't
possibly be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Innovative
DUI Trial Tools because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you sometimes have
book but you rarely get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this with your
hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still
want to miss this? Find this book in addition to read it from today!

Cheri Turner:

Is it a person who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Innovative DUI Trial Tools can
be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your free time
by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?

Jeffrey Garner:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose typically the book Innovative DUI Trial Tools to make
your current reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading ability is developing when you including
reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the feeling about book and
reading through especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside that
the e-book Innovative DUI Trial Tools can to be your friend when you're really feel alone and confuse using
what must you're doing of their time.
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