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The dramatic relationship between Ray Kroc, the man who amassed  a fortune as chairman of one of
America’s most controversial and iconic companies—McDonald’s—and the passionate woman, his
wife, Joan, who then gave that fortune away.

Beginning in the 1950s, salesman Ray Kroc presided over the transformation of a successful burger stand
into an international brand where millions of people eat each day. All the while he pursued the woman who
would become his third wife, Joan—a woman willing to risk her marriage and her reputation to promote
controversial causes in which she believed.  For sheer emotional firepower, the relationship between Ray and
Joan—whose massive gifts to NPR and the Salvation Army rate her as one of the greatest philanthropists of
our time—has been compared to that of Elizabeth Taylor and Richard Burton.

Equally as dramatic as Ray and Joan’s romance is the story of how Ray wrested control of the company from
the original founders and presided over its growth, once bringing it close to failure before finally
triumphing—and, soon after, finally winning the hand of the love of his life. Together, the two stories form a
compelling portrait of the twentieth century: a story of big business, big love, and big giving.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Inocencia Hensley:

Book will be written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve Ray & Joan: The Man Who Made the
McDonald's Fortune and the Woman Who Gave It All Away will make you to become smarter. You can feel
a lot more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think that open or reading a
book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you trying to
find best book or ideal book with you?

Melissa Alfonso:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the data
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there
are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their proficiency
in writing, they also doing some research before they write to the book. One of them is this Ray & Joan: The
Man Who Made the McDonald's Fortune and the Woman Who Gave It All Away.

Lena Garcia:

The guide with title Ray & Joan: The Man Who Made the McDonald's Fortune and the Woman Who Gave It
All Away posesses a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this
book. This kind of book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this publication represented the
condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world.
This book will bring you in new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book in your smart phone,
so you can read it anywhere you want.

Ali Ellison:

A lot of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the actual book Ray & Joan: The Man Who
Made the McDonald's Fortune and the Woman Who Gave It All Away to make your current reading is
interesting. Your current skill of reading proficiency is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose easy book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation about book and reading through
especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open up a book and read it. Beside that the reserve Ray
& Joan: The Man Who Made the McDonald's Fortune and the Woman Who Gave It All Away can to be your
brand-new friend when you're experience alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of these time.
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