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The history of Hollywood is often seen only through the lens of the major studios, forgetting that many of
Tinseltown's early creations came from micro-studios stretched along Sunset Boulevard in an area
disparagingly known as Poverty Row. Here, the first wave of West Coast moviemakers migrated to the tiny
village of Hollywood, where alcohol was illegal, actors were unwelcome, and cattle were herded down the
unpaved streets. Most Poverty Row producers survived from film to film, their fortunes tied to the previous
week's take from hundreds of nickelodeon tills. They would routinely script movies around an event or
disaster, often creating scenarios using sets from more established productions, when the bosses weren't
looking, of course. Poverty Row quickly became a generic term for other fly-by-night studios throughout the
Los Angeles area. Their struggles to hang on in Hollywood were often more intriguing than the serialized
cliffhangers they produced.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Beckman:

Book will be written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A guide Early Poverty Row Studios
(Images of America) will make you to be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about
every thing. But some of you think that open or reading a book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why
they are often thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suited book with you?

Jeffrey Nathanson:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be up-date about what going on or info even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to you is you don't know which one you should start with. This Early Poverty Row Studios
(Images of America) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Steven Allen:

Typically the book Early Poverty Row Studios (Images of America) has a lot of information on it. So when
you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The
writer makes some research prior to write this book. This book very easy to read you will get the point easily
after looking over this book.

Dorothy Vinson:

A lot of guide has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
most effective book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is named of
book Early Poverty Row Studios (Images of America). You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without
leaving behind the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most
important that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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