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In the last decades, major advances have been made in assisted reproductive technologies (ART) and the
public demand for these procedures has increased globally. All ART clinics, from those just starting out to
the well established, must employ the latest equipment and implement the best practices, while ensuring that
their resources are effectively engaged to optimize patient outcomes. This is a tenet of the fiduciary role of
physicians and it is increasingly recognized as a quantifiable goal regulated by formal certifications and
accreditations. Quality management protocols such as those proposed by the International Organization for
Standardization (ISO) are being rapidly adopted as standards of measure. 

 

Quality Management in ART Clinics: A Practical Guide provides easily adoptable ways to implement and
improve formalized quality management systems. Essential to any clinic to achieve best practices and
maintenance of formal regulatory certifications, this book brings together the know-how of experienced
opinion leaders operating in key areas worldwide. The book offers an overview of primary regulations in the
ART field, with attention to quality management demands, and links specific requirements to practical steps
for implementation. Filled with process and procedure examples, flow diagrams and administrative form
templates, this book is the first of its kind, gathering the necessary elements for optimizing practice,
management, and quality assurance.
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From reader reviews:

Mohammed Thomas:

This Quality Management in ART Clinics: A Practical Guide book is simply not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is actually information
inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you read a lot of
information you will get. This Quality Management in ART Clinics: A Practical Guide without we recognize
teach the one who examining it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't be worry Quality
Management in ART Clinics: A Practical Guide can bring when you are and not make your carrier space or
bookshelves' become full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Quality
Management in ART Clinics: A Practical Guide having excellent arrangement in word as well as layout, so
you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Katherine Ouellette:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now's
taking seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Quality Management in ART Clinics: A Practical Guide
as the daily resource information.

Bruce Sandlin:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of various ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the figures
do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this Quality
Management in ART Clinics: A Practical Guide, you are able to tells your family, friends and also soon
about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a reserve.

Yolanda Nitta:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from the
book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source which filled update of news. Within this
modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social like
newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for the
Quality Management in ART Clinics: A Practical Guide when you required it?
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