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Harry Hopeman, miembro de una dinastía de diamantistas, recibe un día una propuesta: recuperar un
diamante legendario que ha despertado interés de gente muy dispar. El encargo, que llevará a Harry a
abandonar Nueva York para instalarse en Tierra Santa, se convertirá en un viaje casi iniciático en el que el
tratante se reencontrará con sus raíces. La historia del diamante, desde los tiempos bíblicos hasta la
actualidad, sirve no sólo de hilo conductor para narrar las vicisitudes de la familia Hopeman, cuyos orígenes
se remontan a los tiempos de la Inquisición, sino tamién para ofrecer una rica panorámica del judaísmo y su
intensa relación con las culturas musulmana y cristiana a lo largo de los siglos. Con el acierto que le ha
convertido en un referente del género de la narrativa histórica, Noah Gordon parte de una rigurosa
documentación para ofrecer al lector una obra que es un absorbente viaje a través de la Historia, a la vez que
una emocionante novela.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Lemos:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or even goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like reading
through a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise. Well,
probably you'll have this El diamante de Jerusalén (BIBLIOTECA NOAH GORDON) (Spanish Edition).

Joshua Matthews:

The book El diamante de Jerusalén (BIBLIOTECA NOAH GORDON) (Spanish Edition) can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a book El
diamante de Jerusalén (BIBLIOTECA NOAH GORDON) (Spanish Edition)? Wide variety you have a
different opinion about publication. But one aim in which book can give many data for us. It is absolutely
proper. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you may
give for each other; you can share all of these. Book El diamante de Jerusalén (BIBLIOTECA NOAH
GORDON) (Spanish Edition) has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you.
You can look the enormous world by wide open and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Rex Pelkey:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole
day to reading a e-book. The book El diamante de Jerusalén (BIBLIOTECA NOAH GORDON) (Spanish
Edition) it is rather good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These were enjoying
reading this book. When you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the e-book. You can
m0ore effortlessly to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book
features high quality.

Gregory Polster:

You will get this El diamante de Jerusalén (BIBLIOTECA NOAH GORDON) (Spanish Edition) by go to the
bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve problem if you get
difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but
additionally can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking
because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways
to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge



are still up-date. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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