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I met Bob Doroghazi when he dropped the first draft of his manuscript of The Physician’s Guide to
Investing: A Practical Approach to Building Wealth at my office. I will have to admit I was a bit skeptical: a
physician writing a book on investments? During that first meeting with Bob, it became evident that he had
been a successful physician and a successful investor, so I agreed to take a look at the book. I was in for a
pleasant surprise. Bob’s manuscript was easy to read and had specific advice useful to physicians,
interspersed with lots of practical tidbits for any investor. Having written three college-level finance and
investment texts, I was excited to be in on a project aimed at offering practical investment advice to a more
general, yet specialized, audience. I had high expectations for the book and am pleased to say that I believe
Bob has delivered a book that every physician interested in building wealth and protecting assets should
read. Bob is a straight shooter; he tells it like he sees it in his book. Some doctors might be indignant on
reading his statements, such as “Physicians sometimes have no idea of their limitations. This type of
arrogance and ego can result in investing disaster.” However, if you do have these limitations (and most
professionals, even college professors, do), then reading Bob’s book will help you recognize situations in
which they can lead to poor investment decisions.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Carr:

Now a day folks who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be smart
in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Looking at a book can help
people out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Physician's Guide to Investing: A Practical
Approach to Building Wealth book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the data in
this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Robert Russo:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this The Physician's Guide to Investing: A
Practical Approach to Building Wealth guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make
book which can be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you,
dripping every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still question The
Physician's Guide to Investing: A Practical Approach to Building Wealth as good book not just by the cover
but also through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't judge book by its deal with, so do you
still needing one more sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told
you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Lynne Young:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It
all right you can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like The
Physician's Guide to Investing: A Practical Approach to Building Wealth which is having the e-book version.
So , try out this book? Let's view.

James Hanson:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will get it
in e-book approach, more simple and reachable. That The Physician's Guide to Investing: A Practical
Approach to Building Wealth can give you a lot of close friends because by you checking out this one book
you have point that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This specific book can be
one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that probably your friend doesn't
recognize, by knowing more than various other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let us have
The Physician's Guide to Investing: A Practical Approach to Building Wealth.
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