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At a time when popular solutions to the educational plight of poor children of color are imposed from the
outside-national standards, high-stakes tests, charismatic individual saviors-the acclaimed Algebra Project
and its founder, Robert Moses, offer a vision of school reform based in the power of communities. Begun in
1982, the Algebra Project is transforming math education in twenty-five cities. Founded on the belief that
math-science literacy is a prerequisite for full citizenship in society, the Project works with entire
communities-parents, teachers, and especially students-to create a culture of literacy around algebra, a
crucial stepping-stone to college math and opportunity.

Telling the story of this remarkable program, Robert Moses draws on lessons from the 1960s Southern voter
registration he famously helped organize: 'Everyone said sharecroppers didn't want to vote. It wasn't until we
got them demanding to vote that we got attention. Today, when kids are falling wholesale through the cracks,
people say they don't want to learn. We have to get the kids themselves to demand what everyone says they
don't want.'

We see the Algebra Project organizing community by community. Older kids serve as coaches for younger
students and build a self-sustained tradition of leadership. Teachers use innovative techniques. And we see
the remarkable success stories of schools like the predominately poor Hart School in Bessemer, Alabama,
which outscored the city's middle-class flagship school in just three years.

Radical Equations provides a model for anyone looking for a community-based solution to the problems of
our disadvantaged schools.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Mollie Walker:

The particular book Radical Equations: Civil Rights from Mississippi to the Algebra Project will bring one to
the new experience of reading the book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In case you try
to find new book to read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Radical Equations: Civil Rights from
Mississippi to the Algebra Project is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the
official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Dennis Boone:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its cover may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside appearance
likes. Maybe you answer may be Radical Equations: Civil Rights from Mississippi to the Algebra Project
why because the excellent cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint an
individual. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense
will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Marie Velasquez:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Radical Equations: Civil Rights from
Mississippi to the Algebra Project can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus
out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
books have than the others?

Ramon Lopez:

You can find this Radical Equations: Civil Rights from Mississippi to the Algebra Project by look at the
bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your
knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by simply written or printed but also can you enjoy this
book by means of e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your e-book. It is
most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose correct
ways for you.
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