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An unforgettable spiritual autobiography about a search for meaning that begins alongside one of the
great religious icons of our time and ends with a return to the secular world
 
At seventeen, Mary Johnson saw Mother Teresa’s face on the cover of Time and experienced her calling.
Eighteen months later, she entered a convent in the South Bronx to begin her religious training. Not without
difficulty, this bright, independent-minded Texas teenager eventually adapted to the sisters’ austere life of
poverty and devotion, and in time became close to Mother Teresa herself.

Still, beneath the white and blue sari beat the heart of an ordinary young woman facing the struggles we all
share—the desire for love and connection, meaning and identity. During her twenty years with the
Missionaries of Charity, Sister Donata, as she was known, grappled with her faith, her sexuality, the politics
of the order, and her complicated relationship with Mother Teresa. Eventually, she left the church to find her
own path—one that led to love and herself.

Provocative, profound, and emotionally charged, An Unquenchable Thirst presents a rare, privileged view of 
Mother Teresa. At the same time, it is a unique and magnificent memoir of self-discovery.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Anderson:

Do you one among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This An Unquenchable Thirst: A Memoir book is readable by simply you
who hate the perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience
without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer regarding An
Unquenchable Thirst: A Memoir content conveys prospect easily to understand by a lot of people. The
printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different by means of it. So , do you
nonetheless thinking An Unquenchable Thirst: A Memoir is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Henry McMahon:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit
give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside
the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve
you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really feel happy
read one together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the An Unquenchable
Thirst: A Memoir is kind of publication which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Lynette Cavanaugh:

This book untitled An Unquenchable Thirst: A Memoir to be one of several books this best seller in this
year, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this
kind of book in the book retailer or you can order it by means of online. The publisher on this book sells the
e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smartphone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this book from your list.

Guadalupe McCoy:

The book untitled An Unquenchable Thirst: A Memoir contain a lot of information on the item. The writer
explains your girlfriend idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to implement all the people,
so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored by famous author. The author
will take you in the new age of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can continue reading
your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the
e-book, you can open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice study.
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