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Louis A. Havens was a Southern California pioneer businessman, storyteller, and artist who brought the
community of Escondido together via his camera. He was the first successful photographer in the thriving
north San Diego County agricultural city, incorporated in 1888. Prior to his arrival, the occasional
photographer might seasonally visit Escondido or attempt to set up shop, realizing little success. Havens's
timing in his arrival, combined with his skillful eye, ensured his success from 1911 to 1944. His collection
documents Escondido's early residents, architecture, events, and landscapes, and it now persists as a historic
record of past events, culture, and development of the fourth largest city in San Diego County.
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From reader reviews:

Teddy Mendoza:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to
something different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your
free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you
want to try look for book, may be the book untitled Early Escondido: The Louis A. Havens Collection can be
fine book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Elizabeth Ashton:

The actual book Early Escondido: The Louis A. Havens Collection has a lot of information on it. So when
you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very famous author. Mcdougal
makes some research prior to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may get the point
easily after reading this book.

Larry Mason:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Early Escondido: The Louis A.
Havens Collection guide written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that could be
understand by anyone who else read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
producing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Early Escondido: The
Louis A. Havens Collection as good book not simply by the cover but also with the content. This is one
guide that can break don't determine book by its include, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to
pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to
listening to an additional sixth sense.

Darlene Heckart:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year seemed to
be exactly added. This book Early Escondido: The Louis A. Havens Collection was filled regarding science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has diverse feel when
they reading the book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a guide. In
the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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