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The worst cookbook ever, packed with truly bizarre and utterly disgusting recipes from all over the world

Ever since humankind produced its first foodie, the culinary world has dished up some staggering
confections which could best be described as 'acquired tastes': dishes such as Virgin Boy Eggs (eggs soaked
in the urine of prepubescent boys); live octopus, which clutches at the diner's tongue and throat as it is
swallowed; and Beard Beer, made from the yeast found in facial hair.

In northern Greenland, the Inuit are fond of cramming as many as 500 dead auks (small sea birds) into an old
seal skin which they place under a large rock until the birds have fermented into what has rightly been
described as a 'sticky, pungent, toxic, cheesy gloop'. Kiviak, as it is called, is eaten by biting off the birds'
heads and sucking out the juices.

The mighty Roman Empire was built on such delicacies as larks' tongues, stuffed thrush, boiled flamingo and
grilled cow's womb, while the Tudors loved nothing more than a roast cockenthrice: the head and upper body
of a pig carefully stitched onto the lower body and legs of a turkey.

Today, for those with an adventurous mindset and a robust life insurance policy, there is no shortage of
nauseating local delicacies to enjoy. In China, not only is tuna eyeball on the menu, but also yak penis
(served whole). In Vietnam, one can enjoy the still-beating heart of a freshly-killed snake; in Iceland, raw
puffin heart. In the Philippines, there is duck embryo to be had - like a Kinder Surprise . . . only containing a
dead foetus instead of a toy. In Sardinia, they like nothing more than a nice bit of maggot-infested cheese;
and the favourite tipple of Korean foodies is Ttongsul, a wine made from the fermented faeces of a child.

Bon appetit!
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From reader reviews:

Michael Harmon:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This Crap Kitchen: Boiled gannet, calf-brain custard and other 'acquired tastes'
book is readable through you who hate the straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for
enjoyable reading through experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to give to
you. The writer of Crap Kitchen: Boiled gannet, calf-brain custard and other 'acquired tastes' content conveys
the idea easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it
just different available as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Crap Kitchen: Boiled gannet, calf-brain
custard and other 'acquired tastes' is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Katrina Roberts:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or their
own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic inside the
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book can be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the e-book untitled Crap Kitchen: Boiled gannet, calf-brain custard and other 'acquired tastes'
can be great book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Charles Edwards:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get lots of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then do you try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the
actual book you have read is actually Crap Kitchen: Boiled gannet, calf-brain custard and other 'acquired
tastes'.

Robert Beaubien:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or created from each source which filled update of news.
Within this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, new and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out
your book? Or just searching for the Crap Kitchen: Boiled gannet, calf-brain custard and other 'acquired
tastes' when you required it?
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