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This volume grew out of a conference organized by James Alleman and Paul Rappoport, conducted on
October 10, 2011 in Jackson Hole, Wyoming, in honor of the work of Lester D. Taylor, whose pioneering
work in demand and market analysis has had profound implications on research across a wide spectrum of
industries.  In his Prologue, Eli M. Noam notes that demand analysis in the information sector must
recognize the “public good” characteristics of media products and networks, while taking into account the
effects of interdependent user behavior; the strong cross-elasticities in a market; as well as the phenomenon
of supply creating its own demand.  The second Prologue, by Timothy Tardiff and Daniel Levy, focuses
more specifically on Taylor’s body of work, in particular its practical applications and usefulness in analyses
of, and practices within, the Information and Communications Technology  (ICT) sector (known in Europe
and elsewhere as the Telecommunications, Media, and Technology (TMT) sector).  The remainder of the
book is organized into four parts:  Advances in Theory; Empirical Applications; Evidence-Based Policy
Applications; and a final Conclusion.  The book closes with an Appendix by Sharon Levin and Stanford
Levin detailing Taylor’s contributions using bibliometrics. Not only featuring chapters from distinguished
scholars in economics, applied sciences, and technology, this volume includes two contributions directly
from Lester Taylor, providing unique insight into economics from a lifetime in the field.

 

 “What a worthy book! Every applied researcher in communications encounters Lester Taylor’s work. Many
empirical exercises in communications can trace their roots to Taylor’s pioneering research and his
thoughtful leadership. This book assembles an impressive set of contributors and contributions to honor
Taylor. No surprise, the collection extends far and wide into many of the core topics of communications and
media markets. The emphasis is where it should be–on important and novel research questions informed by
useful data. —Shane Greenstein, Professor of Management and Strategy, Kellogg School of Management,
Northwestern University

 

 

“For more than 40 years, Lester Taylor has been a leader in the application of consumer modeling,
econometric techniques and microeconomic data to understand residential and business user behavior in
telecommunications markets. During that time, he inspired a cadre of students and colleagues who applied
this potent combination to address critical corporate and

regulatory issues arising in the telecommunications sector. This volume collects the recent product of many
of these same researchers and several other devotees who go beyond empirical analysis of fixed line service
by extending Prof. Taylor’s approach to the next wave of services and technologies. These contributions,
including two new papers by Prof. Taylor, offer an opportunity for the next generation to learn from his work



as it grapples with the pressing issues of consumer demand in the rapidly evolving digital economy.” —
Glenn Woroch, Adjunct Professor of Economics, University of California, Berkeley
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From reader reviews:

Kathy Natal:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each book has different aim or goal; it means that publication has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They can be reading whatever
they consider because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like looking
at a book? Sometime, person feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise. Well, probably
you will require this Demand for Communications Services - Insights and Perspectives: Essays in Honor of
Lester D. Taylor (The Economics of Information, Communication, and Entertainment).

Edwin Ball:

The event that you get from Demand for Communications Services - Insights and Perspectives: Essays in
Honor of Lester D. Taylor (The Economics of Information, Communication, and Entertainment) could be the
more deep you looking the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It
does not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Demand for Communications Services - Insights and
Perspectives: Essays in Honor of Lester D. Taylor (The Economics of Information, Communication, and
Entertainment) giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in a number of way
that can be understood through anyone who read the idea because the author of this publication is well-
known enough. This book also makes your vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go
along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this kind of Demand for
Communications Services - Insights and Perspectives: Essays in Honor of Lester D. Taylor (The Economics
of Information, Communication, and Entertainment) instantly.

Cristen Washington:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or
their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic from
the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to
fill your own free time/ holiday? May be reading a book might be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The
first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to consider look for
book, may be the e-book untitled Demand for Communications Services - Insights and Perspectives: Essays
in Honor of Lester D. Taylor (The Economics of Information, Communication, and Entertainment) can be
great book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Earl Parker:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get lots of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely



without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read will be Demand for Communications Services - Insights and Perspectives: Essays in Honor of Lester D.
Taylor (The Economics of Information, Communication, and Entertainment).
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