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The 2d Ranger Infantry Company (Airborne) was the first and only all-black Ranger unit in the history of the
United States Army. Its ten-month lifespan included selection, training, and seven months of combat
deployment in Korea, after which the unit was deactivated. Edward Posey’s magnificent new study, now
available in paperback, is the first complete history of this elite, all-volunteer unit, whose members were
drawn from the 3rd Battalion of the 505th Airborne Infantry Regiment and the 80th Airborne Anti-Aircraft
Battalion.

After experiencing the normal travails of boot camp at Fort Benning, which segregation and racism only
made worse, the all-black Rangers set out to join the Korean War in late 1950. On January 7, 1951, the
Rangers found themselves defending a critical railroad running through Tanyang Pass, which Communist
guerillas tried to infiltrate. The nighttime action triggered the Rangers’ inaugural combat, which ended with
the recommendation for a Bronze Star for gallantry for a Ranger sergeant. Additional combats with the North
Korean and Communist Chinese forces erupted near Majori-ri and Chechon.

But the event that propelled the 2d Rangers into the record books was their airborne assault near Munsan-Ni
on March 23, 1951—the first in Ranger history. Once on the ground, Posey and his comrades attacked and
captured Hill 151. The fighting—often conducted at very close quarters, and some of it with the bayonet and
rifle butt—demonstrated the courage of these tough African American soldiers. Heavy fighting marked their
months at the front, including a magnificent attack and defense of Hill 581 that May. Throughout their
deployment in Korea, the 2d Rangers served with honor and achieved an outstanding combat record.

Posey’s long overdue The US Army’s First, Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d Ranger Infantry
Company (Airborne) in the Korean War, 1950-1951 (written with the help of other Rangers) is based upon
the firsthand experiences of many members of the unit, official records, interviews with survivors, and other
archival material. Stitched together, this information offers a rich and worthy addition to the growing
literature on the Korean War by explaining the obstacles these patriotic African Americans faced, their
sacrifices, and their courageous actions on the far side of the world.

Nearly sixty years have passed since the Korean War slipped into the realm of history. Now, the world will
finally learn the true story of the United States Army’s first, last, and only all-black Ranger unit.

About the Author: Master Sergeant (Ret) Edward L. Posey joined the US Army in 1947. After serving with
Company L, 3rd Battalion, 505th Airborne Infantry Regiment, he volunteered for airborne training with the
Rangers in 1950 and served with distinction in the Korean War (where he was wounded). Sergeant Posey
retired from the service in 1969. In 2002, he was inducted into the Ranger Hall of Fame for his dedication to
duty and distinguished military career.
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From reader reviews:

Micheal Ruiz:

This US Army's First, Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d Ranger Infantry Company (Airborne) in the
Korean War, 1950-1951 book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you receive by reading this book will be information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get
details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This kind of US Army's
First, Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d Ranger Infantry Company (Airborne) in the Korean War,
1950-1951 without we understand teach the one who reading it become critical in thinking and analyzing.
Don't possibly be worry US Army's First, Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d Ranger Infantry
Company (Airborne) in the Korean War, 1950-1951 can bring when you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even phone. This US
Army's First, Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d Ranger Infantry Company (Airborne) in the Korean
War, 1950-1951 having very good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not experience
uninterested in reading.

Jeffrey Messina:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book entitled US
Army's First, Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d Ranger Infantry Company (Airborne) in the Korean
War, 1950-1951 your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that
maybe unidentified for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a reserve then
become one web form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get ahead of. The US Army's First,
Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d Ranger Infantry Company (Airborne) in the Korean War, 1950-
1951 giving you yet another experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful details
for your better life on this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will be
pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Diana Johnson:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find reserve that need more time to be
study. US Army's First, Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d Ranger Infantry Company (Airborne) in
the Korean War, 1950-1951 can be your answer mainly because it can be read by a person who have those
short spare time problems.

Christopher Walker:

As a university student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the



library or to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
spirit or real their hobby. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
presently there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit
your needs. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word
says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this US Army's First, Last, and Only All-Black Rangers: The 2d
Ranger Infantry Company (Airborne) in the Korean War, 1950-1951 can make you feel more interested to
read.
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