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Retired Army Staff Sergeant Lee Winters is trying hard to adjust to civilian life. She was released from duty
after a bomb in Ramadi injured her and killed her troops, the only people she ever considered her family.
Living day-to-day with the knowledge that she was the only one left alive, she hits rock bottom, and an old
army buddy persuades her into taking a bodyguard job. Jolene West is injured in an attack meant to get her
famous sister's attention. She resents her sister Tory's life and plans to move away once she's healed. In the
meantime, Tory has hired a bodyguard to protect Jolene from further attacks, which is just one more thing
she resents. What she hadn't planned on was an undeniable attraction to the woman protecting her body.
Both women will try to fight their growing attraction for each other until one of them gives in or dies.
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From reader reviews:

Rhonda Munoz:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make you more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read
this Secrets and Shadows, it is possible to tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours reserve.
Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a guide.

Kimberly Niemeyer:

The reserve untitled Secrets and Shadows is the publication that recommended to you to see. You can see the
quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person. The language that article author use to explained
their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, and
so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Secrets and
Shadows from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

James Ensor:

Is it a person who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Secrets and Shadows can be the
answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by
reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?

Dora Champagne:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or created from each source which filled update of news.
Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book?
Or just looking for the Secrets and Shadows when you necessary it?
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