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We no longer have a Constitutional system of checks and balances. SCOTUS in its 2015 King and
Obergefell decisions proved that, but it's not over. Marbury v. Madison, 5 U.S. 137 (1803) was the landmark
Supreme Court case that established the doctrine of Judicial Review and set in stone the system of checks
and balances that are articulated in the United States Constitution. However, on June 25, 2015, the Supreme
Court finally and completely broke trust with that precedent, the United States Constitution, and We the
People of America! In King v. Burwell, the Supreme Court changed the express words of the legislation
passed by the U.S. Congress, and substituted their will for the Law. The very next day, in Obergefell v.
Hodges, the Supreme Court again broke trust and usurped the Constitutional jurisdiction of the states and the
people, and rewrote 5,000 years of an established definition of marriage and fabricated Constitutional
protections for a deviant class it supported. In the words of Justice Antonin Scalia in his Obergefell dissent,
"This is a naked judicial claim to legislative—indeed, super-legislative—power; a claim fundamentally at
odds with our system of government…A system of government that makes the People subordinate to a
committee of nine unelected lawyers does not deserve to be called a democracy." "Breaking Trust with the
Constitution" tracks the high Court's rise and fall ... and possible reclamation!
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From reader reviews:

Courtney O\'Donnell:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need more
time to be learn. Breaking Trust with the Constitution: The Rise & Fall of the U.S. Supreme Court can be
your answer given it can be read by a person who have those short spare time problems.

Kathryn Robinson:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you
learn a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and soon.
The Breaking Trust with the Constitution: The Rise & Fall of the U.S. Supreme Court provide you with a
new experience in examining a book.

Kimberly Spradlin:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
much easier to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet,
classifieds, book, and soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book.
Typically the book that recommended for you is Breaking Trust with the Constitution: The Rise & Fall of the
U.S. Supreme Court this book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This
particular book was represented how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use for
explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That is
why this book ideal all of you.

David McCabe:

Book is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen want book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. By the book Breaking Trust with the Constitution: The Rise & Fall of the U.S. Supreme Court we can
consider more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? Being creative person must prefer to
read a book. Just choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change
your life with that book Breaking Trust with the Constitution: The Rise & Fall of the U.S. Supreme Court.
You can more attractive than now.
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