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The day the First World War broke out, Alfie Summerfield's father promised he wouldn't go away to
fight—but he broke that promise the following day. Four years later, Alfie doesn't know where his father
might be, other than that he's away on a special, secret mission. Then, while shining shoes at King's Cross
Station, Alfie unexpectedly sees his father's name on a sheaf of papers belonging to a military doctor.
Bewildered and confused, Alfie realizes his father is in a hospital close by—a hospital treating soldiers with
shell shock. Alfie isn't sure what shell shock is, but he is determined to rescue his father from this strange,
unnerving place. . . .
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From reader reviews:

Adam Rucks:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book entitled Stay Where You Are
And Then Leave? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time
with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have other
opinion?

Richard Kitterman:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try and and must have the free time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have when
the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is
actually Stay Where You Are And Then Leave.

Denise Wallis:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to pick
one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its handle may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
search likes. Maybe you answer could be Stay Where You Are And Then Leave why because the fantastic
cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is usually
fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Stacy Abercrombie:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in comparison
with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find
publication that need more time to be go through. Stay Where You Are And Then Leave can be your answer
because it can be read by a person who have those short extra time problems.
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