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The 1859 gold rush brought swift change to the Colorado region, but it had little impact on the Fraser Valley.
Hemmed in by mountains, hammered by cold winters, and lacking in mineral wealth, the valley resisted all
but the hardiest settlers. The railroad arrived in 1904 via a torturous crossing of the Continental Divide,
ending the isolation and ushering in a ranching and logging boom. Towns sprang up overnight, and the forest
filled with logging camps and sawmills. Hard times in the 1920s and 1930s were tempered by the
construction of US Highway 40, a major coast-to-coast route that bisected the valley, as well as the
completion of the Moffat Tunnel, a six-mile bore that eased the passage of trains and the diversion of
precious valley water. During the 1950s and 1960s, tourism grew in popularity. Logging gave way to
lodging, and log cabins morphed into condominiums. By 1970, outdoor recreation dominated the local
economy.
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From reader reviews:

Millard Lopez:

The e-book untitled Fraser Valley, The (Images of America) is the book that recommended to you you just
read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The language that creator
use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of analysis when write the
book, hence the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly
get the e-book of Fraser Valley, The (Images of America) from the publisher to make you far more enjoy
free time.

Rudy Hendren:

The reserve with title Fraser Valley, The (Images of America) contains a lot of information that you can
study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world right now. That is important
to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you with new era
of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Ryan Walker:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled Fraser Valley, The (Images of America) your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in most aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging every single
word written in a publication then become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you
never get before. The Fraser Valley, The (Images of America) giving you yet another experience more than
blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful facts for your better life in this era. So now let us
present to you the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are
finished reading through it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time
activity?

Beverly Woods:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we would like. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This e-book Fraser Valley, The (Images of America) was filled concerning
science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has
diverse feel when they reading the book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can truly feel enjoy
to read a e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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