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No poem in German literature is so well known and studied in Germany and Europe as the 800-year-old Das
Nibelungenlied. In the English-speaking world, however, the poem has remained little known, languishing
without an adequate translation. This wonderful new translation by eminent translator Burton Raffel brings
the epic poem to life in English for the first time, rendering it in verse that does full justice to the original
High Middle German. His translation underscores the formal aspects of the poem and preserves its haunting
beauty. Often called the German lliad, Das Nibelungenlied is a heroic epic both national in character and
sweeping in scope. The poem moves inexorably from romance through tragedy to holocaust. It portrays the
existential struggles and downfall of an entire people, the Burgundians, in a military conflict with the Huns
and their king. In his foreword to the book, Michael Dirda observes that the story “could be easily updated to
describe the downfall of a Mafia crime family, something like The Godfather, with swords.” The tremendous
appeal of Das Nibelungenlied throughout the nineteenth and twentieth centuries is reflected in such works as
Richard Wagner’s opera tetralogy Der Ring des Nibelungen, Fritz Lang’s two-part film Die Nibelungen, and,
more recently, J. R. R. Tolkien’s The Lord of the Rings.  
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From reader reviews:

Alan Johnson:

This book untitled Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs to be one of several books that best seller in
this year, honestly, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will
easily to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher on this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Cell
phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this book from your list.

Donovan Pena:

Often the book Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you check
out this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal
makes some research prior to write this book. That book very easy to read you can get the point easily after
perusing this book.

Irving Gaston:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this guide. This Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs
is simple to develop you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not
include much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you quicker
to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when one buys this book.

Lorraine Prinz:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity with family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the
Nibelungs which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

Download and Read Online Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the
Nibelungs #I0NZ4A1XGMO



Read Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs for online ebook

Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books, books to read, good books to
read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub, read books online, books to
read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books to read Das
Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs books to read online.

Online Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs ebook PDF download

Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs Doc

Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs Mobipocket

Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs EPub

Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs Ebook online

Das Nibelungenlied: Song of the Nibelungs Ebook PDF


