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This book is concerned with the provision of health information remotely via the latest communications
technologies. The rapidly aging population has led governments to seek more effective methods of
maintaining high standards of public health through the cultivation of healthy living, as well as improved and
more efficiently delivered health advice and diagnostic services. Experiments with remote provision of
health information and transactional services have been piloted to assess in this context the efficacy of new
communications technologies, such as personal computers linked to the Internet, interactive digital television
in the home, and electronically networked touch-screen kiosks in public locations. Such developments
represent part of a wider agenda--through electronic government--to cultivate more dynamic democracies
and involve citizens of a time of growing political alienation. The impact of such developments can only
properly be established through systematic empirical research. This book examines what has been learned
from research-based evaluations of digital health projects.

It draws upon research from different parts of the world and offers an up-to-date review of the literature in
this field. It also presents a detailed account of recent research carried out in Britain on the effectiveness of
government-sponsored pilot health information, advice and transactional services provided via kiosks, the
Internet, and interactive digital television. It considers the effectiveness of these communications
technologies in relation to a range of distinct applications, their use by the public and perceived usefulness
and authority, and the potential of remote health delivery to support or supplant more traditional and direct
forms of health diagnosis and treatment.

The book will be of interest to those involved in the academic study of digital media developments, e-
government and remote health, as well as to policy-makers and practitioners working in these rapidly
growing fields of endeavor.
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From reader reviews:

Katie Martinez:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible Digital Health: Meeting Patient
and Professional Needs Online? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You understand beside you can
spend your time with the favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you
have other opinion?

Mildred Parker:

The book Digital Health: Meeting Patient and Professional Needs Online make you feel enjoy for your spare
time. You should use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you
getting tension or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book Digital
Health: Meeting Patient and Professional Needs Online to become your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You
can know everything if you like open and read a publication Digital Health: Meeting Patient and Professional
Needs Online. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or some others. So ,
how do you think about this reserve?

Michael Jones:

The publication untitled Digital Health: Meeting Patient and Professional Needs Online is the guide that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to
an individual. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand.
The article writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, hence the information that they share to
your account is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Digital Health: Meeting Patient and
Professional Needs Online from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Mark Smith:

The book untitled Digital Health: Meeting Patient and Professional Needs Online contain a lot of information
on the item. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was compiled by famous
author. The author brings you in the new time of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you
can read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation
you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice go
through.
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