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First printed in 1918, Ralph Werther's Autobiography of an Androgyne charts his emerging self-
understanding as a member of the "third sex" and documents his explorations of queer underworlds in turn-
of-the-century New York City. Werther presents a sensational life narrative that begins with a privileged
upper-class birth and a youthful realization of his difference from other boys. He concludes with a decision
to undergo castration. Along the way, he recounts intimate stories of adolescent sexual encounters with adult
men and women, escapades as a reckless "fairie" who trolled Brooklyn and the Bowery in search of
working-class Irish and Italian immigrants, and an immersion into the subculture of male "inverts." This new
edition also includes a critical introduction by Scott Herring that situates the text within the scientific,
historical, literary, and social contexts of urban American life in the late-nineteenth and early-twentieth
centuries. Tracing how this pioneering autobiography engages with conversations on immigration, gender,
economics, metropolitan working-class culture, and the invention of homosexuality across class lines, this
edition is ideal for courses on topics ranging from Victorian literature to modern American sexuality.
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From reader reviews:

Thelma Price:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These
are reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who
don't like examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Autobiography of an Androgyne (Subterranean Lives).

Jesus Novak:

Now a day those who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Studying a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Autobiography of an Androgyne
(Subterranean Lives) book since this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in
this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Alexander Taylor:

This Autobiography of an Androgyne (Subterranean Lives) are usually reliable for you who want to certainly
be a successful person, why. The reason of this Autobiography of an Androgyne (Subterranean Lives) can be
one of several great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple studying food but feed
you actually with information that probably will shock your previous knowledge. This book will be handy,
you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed
versions. Beside that this Autobiography of an Androgyne (Subterranean Lives) giving you an enormous of
experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that could it useful in your day
task. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Cassandra Harvey:

This book untitled Autobiography of an Androgyne (Subterranean Lives) to be one of several books which
best seller in this year, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will
easily to buy this particular book in the book retailer or you can order it by means of online. The publisher on
this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, because you can read this book in
your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this guide from your list.
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