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Alois Siska was born in Czechoslovakia and learnt to fly. He escaped to the UK after the German invasion
and joined the R.A.F. He describes his experiences flying Wellington bombers. In December 1943 he was
shot down and he and surviving members of the crew were adrift in the North Sea for 7 days in appalling
conditions. Picked up by the Germans he underwent surgery to his badly wounded legs and became a POW.
He suffered at the hands of the Gestapo and was held in numerous camps including Colditz. His injuries
were so extensive that he was put under the care of Archibald McIndoe. Siska chose to return to his native
country to join their air force but fell foul of the Communist authorities. His persecution is described in the
closing chapters. His rank was restored only in 1991 on the collapse of the Communist regime. Despite his
injuries he remained active until 2003 when he died just short of his 90th birthday. He was as an active
member of the Czech Ex-R.A.F. Association, the R.A.F. Benevolent Fund in his country, and the Sue Ryder
Homes for which he raised considerable funds. His death was marked with a fly-past of the Czech Air Force
and he was posthumously awarded the highest military decoration - The Order of the White Lion.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Haakenson:

This Flying for Freedom: The Flying, Survival and Captivity Experiences of a Czech Pilot in the Second
World War are reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The main reason of this
Flying for Freedom: The Flying, Survival and Captivity Experiences of a Czech Pilot in the Second World
War can be one of many great books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading through
food but feed you actually with information that might be will shock your prior knowledge. This book will
be handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed types. Beside
that this Flying for Freedom: The Flying, Survival and Captivity Experiences of a Czech Pilot in the Second
World War giving you an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical
thinking that we realize it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Glady Curry:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the name Flying for
Freedom: The Flying, Survival and Captivity Experiences of a Czech Pilot in the Second World War suitable
to you? Often the book was written by well known writer in this era. Often the book untitled Flying for
Freedom: The Flying, Survival and Captivity Experiences of a Czech Pilot in the Second World Waris a
single of several books which everyone read now. This specific book was inspired many people in the world.
When you read this reserve you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know ahead of. The
author explained their thought in the simple way, so all of people can easily to know the core of this guide.
This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the
world in this book.

Norma Harrell:

You can obtain this Flying for Freedom: The Flying, Survival and Captivity Experiences of a Czech Pilot in
the Second World War by browse the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your
solve trouble if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only
through written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you
just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get
more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are
still update. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Katherine Contreras:

A lot of book has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the most effective book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is
known as of book Flying for Freedom: The Flying, Survival and Captivity Experiences of a Czech Pilot in
the Second World War. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could



possibly add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about
reserve. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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