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West Point is the ideal laboratory for studying the dynamics of character, honor, and leadership: first, it
operates a comprehensive honor education and enforcement program that has been subjected to rigorous
Congressional scrutiny; second, it builds all of its academic, athletic, and military programs on this bedrock
of honor. As a result, West Point invests heavily in mentoring, training, and evaluation to ensure the
leadership and character development of its 4,000 cadets. From Civil War General Robert E. Lee to astronaut
Edwin E. Buzz Aldrin to basketball coach Mike Krzyzewski, West Point has groomed leaders whose
contributions far exceed the successful management of their immediate charges. By illuminating the
principles by which West Point teaches leadership, Stand Your Ground not only provides a unique tour
behind the scenes at this revered institution, but, more generally, imparts lessons of honor and character-
building that can be adopted by any aspiring leader.

Management professor and West Point graduate Evan Offstein approached leaders at the U.S. Military
Academy and the Department of the Army with two primary questions: (1) How does West Point develop its
leaders?; (2) Can other individuals and organizations apply these methods effectively? Two years later, after
conducting extensive on-site research at West Point and with business leaders in a variety of industries, he
offers unprecedented access to the process of leadership development at West Point, and practical insights
that can, indeed, be applied in any type of organization that strives to operate on the principle of integrity.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Abrams:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere. The
information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider while those
information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen in you if you take Stand Your Ground: Building Honorable Leaders the West Point Way as the
daily resource information.

Christy Brodersen:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not seeking Stand Your Ground:
Building Honorable Leaders the West Point Way that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied
simply by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to
know world much better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be explained constantly that
reading behavior only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to possibly be success
person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you could pick Stand Your
Ground: Building Honorable Leaders the West Point Way become your starter.

Sandra Davis:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its include may doesn't work
at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer can be Stand Your Ground: Building Honorable Leaders the West
Point Way why because the amazing cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint
you. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will
directly guide you to pick up this book.

Anna Bailey:

Book is one of source of information. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen need book to know the change information of year in order to year. As we know those textbooks have
many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. By book
Stand Your Ground: Building Honorable Leaders the West Point Way we can have more advantage. Don't
that you be creative people? To be creative person must prefer to read a book. Simply choose the best book
that acceptable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this book Stand Your Ground: Building
Honorable Leaders the West Point Way. You can more attractive than now.
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